
BNIM is seeking a talented landscape architecture intern in its downtown 
Kansas City offi ce. The internship would last from January through 
August 2016. 

Landscape Architecture is an integrated function of the design process at 
BNIM. Our unique collaboration process is core to our knowledge and 
learning-based organization. As a provider of landscape architecture and 
planning services, BNIM shapes environments that are healthy, effi cient 
and responsive to clients’ needs. Landscape Architecture overlaps with 
other design services. It brings with it a depth of expertise that maximizes 
the relationship between indoor and outdoor environments at every level 
of the site, scope and size of the project. Our strategic approach to 
landscape architecture aims to capitalize on the benefi ts of the resources 
we use while minimizing the environmental impact.

With 45 years of experience as a multidisciplinary architectural fi rm, 
BNIM has built a reputation for thoughtful, responsive and restorative 
design. The fi rm’s areas of expertise include sustainable design and com-
munity redevelopment, educational facilities, campus master planning,  
corporate offi ce spaces and urban design. 

Internship candidates should be effective collaborators, passionate about 
sustainability, and committed to the highest level of design ideas and 
excellence. Good hand drawn graphic skills and profi ciency in AutoCAD 
are essential. Experience in GIS, Adobe Suite and other presentation 
software are a plus but not required. 

Contact: Please forward a resume, examples of your best work in digital 
form, and references to careers@bnim.com before noon on October 21st.
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