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Remos Lenio has a background in corporate finance where he has over 25 years of 
experience representing buyers and sellers of businesses and clients seeking financing. After 
receiving his M.B.A. from the Ross School of Business at the University of Michigan and a 
B.S in Business from Central Michigan University, Remos began his professional career in the 
workout division of a large money center bank, which was established to resolve troubled oil 
and gas credits originated by the Penn Square Bank. He next served in the merchant banking 
division of a regional bank that was established to invest in the equity of troubled or 
underperforming companies. From there, Remos became the CFO of a troubled holding 
company where he was responsible for winding down the troubled divisions and selling the 
healthy divisions. Subsequently, he worked in the corporate finance division of a regional 
accounting firm where he was responsible for the west Michigan practice from where he left to 
form Hartwick Capital, a boutique merchant bank, which merged with DWA to form DWH in 
2009. 
 
Remos is an accomplished and experienced transaction specialist having significant 
experience with mergers, acquisitions, purchase, sales and buyouts of privately held 
companies, recapitalizations, startups, and valuations of companies by and for investors 
across many industries, including manufacturing, distribution, agriculture, service, and energy. 
He brings his expertise to DWH clients as he assists them with transactions, investments, 
capital sourcing, company portfolio management, and valuations. 
As a Managing Partner, Remos is very hands-on and is personally involved with many 
projects, advising well over 100 companies with regards to their sale, purchase, or financing 
options, and performing hundreds of valuations both for internal use and as finished work 
product for clients. Much of his work is with clients going through transition – helping them to 
recapitalize or reposition for a future under different ownership or with different capital 
partners supporting their growth. He has also been a part of structuring deals to assist with 
generational transitions. 
 


